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READY TO TAKE THE NEXT STEP HERE AT 
RENOVATION?
Come serve alongside us on Sunday mornings! Our prayer is that every adult who calls Renovation Church their 
home will pick up an oar and join in our mission to follow Jesus and help others do the same. Our volunteer ministry 
teams require that you serve a minimum of two services per month so that our volunteers can stay sharp in their 
serving role and get to know others on their team as well! We do recommend that you be a part of no more than two 
ministry teams at one time. Check out the team descriptions below to find which one is the right fit for you!

RENOVATION KIDS
Renovation Kids is passionate about helping children ages 0 to 11 grow in their faith! There are multiple fun and 
engaging roles that you can choose from in this area: caring for little ones in the nursery, teaching or assisting in 
the classrooms, helping families check their kids in for the morning, working with special needs children, or leading 
worship. 

GREETING TEAM
The Greeting Team welcomes people to Renovation Church with a friendly “hello” and a smile. They hold open the 
doors at the main entrances and Worship Center. The Greeting Team plays an integral role in providing a welcoming 
environment to all who come to worship at Renovation Church on a Sunday morning. 

CREW TEAM
Come join the crew of volunteers that sets and resets the Worship Center for each of our Sunday morning services. 
Members of this team help to quickly restock items under each chair in the Worship Center so that anyone who 
comes to a service has available to them a Bible, a pen, a giving envelope, and any other materials needed for that 
Sunday morning. 

USHER TEAM
The Usher Team is committed to providing as much seating as possible in the Worship Center by helping people find 
an available place to sit. Volunteers on the Usher Team welcome people when they enter the Worship Center and 
direct them to a row that has enough seating for their group size. 

Baptism is an amazing part of a person’s faith journey in publicly declaring their faith in Jesus, and preparing the 
stage for performing baptisms takes work! The Baptism Team takes responsibility for preparing the stage in the 
Worship Center for those being baptized, and then resetting the stage afterwards. This team helps set up and reset 
in a quick and non-distracting manner during each baptism service. Members of this team must be able to carry 
heavy loads. 

BAPTISM TEAM

CAFE TEAM
The Cafe Team creates an inviting atmosphere in the lobby of Renovation Church where people feel welcome to 
connect and socialize with one another on Sunday mornings. Cafe volunteers serve a variety of baked goods and 
they keep the coffee flowing all morning long. Renovation Church’s cafe is open before, during, and after services 
every Sunday.



AUDIO/VISUAL TEAM 

The Audio/Visual Team helps create an engaging environment while people worship and listen to the message on 
Sunday mornings. The volunteers on this team run our soundboard, ProPresenter, video, and lighting. Each of 
these roles are so important that we recommend these volunteers be extremely detail-oriented! Audio/Visual Team 
volunteers are scheduled to serve the entire morning when they volunteer. 

WORSHIP TEAM
Worship Team members play a huge role in providing an experience where people can encounter God during 
our services! Due to the complexity of the position, we do require everyone to go through an audition process. 
Auditions happen twice annually. Worship Team rehearsals are on Thursday evenings for the following Sunday, and 
the Sunday morning time commitment is from 7:00AM - 12:45PM. 

PARKING TEAM
The Parking Team is our team of first impressions. They are the first volunteers to welcome people to Renovation 
Church, so this role is an important one! Parking volunteers warmly welcome people as they arrive and help direct 
vehicles to open parking spots.  In the winter, part of the team also treats ice and makes sure that any freshly fallen 
snow is cleared from sidewalks. Members of the parking team must be at least 16 years of age.

STREET SIGNS
The Street Signs Team is responsible for placing and picking up six Renovation Church A-frame signs each weekend. 
The signs are set up on Friday evening and taken down on Sunday afternoon. We average almost one new visitor a 
WEEK from street signs alone! 

LANDSCAPING TEAM
Help keep the Renovation Church grounds looking beautiful by joining the Landscaping Team! The Landscaping 
Team works together throughout the year to maintain the plants and rocky areas of the church property by pulling 
weeds, picking up trash, and conducting other routine seasonal landscaping tasks. A unique aspect of joining this 
team is the ability to serve independently as you are able during the week.

SAFETY TEAM
The Safety Team serves to provide a safe and secure environment at Renovation Church on Sunday mornings and 
during other church-related events.  Members of the team keep an eye out for any concerning activity and provide 
first-aid medical attention if needed.  Relevant experience in the medical and/or security field(s) are preferred for 
members of this team.

PHOTOGRAPHY TEAM
The Photography Team visually captures the ministry and events that take place at Renovation Church. Volunteers 
serve 15 minutes before, during, and after any service on their scheduled date, and are responsible for promptly 
uploading the photos that they take. Relevant experience in photography and/or videography is preferred for 
members of this team.

LIBRARY TEAM
Renovation Church’s Library’s goal is to provide a premier collection of resources that equip Renovation Church 
members and community friends in growing in Christ-likeness. Library Team members will facilitate access to those 
resources by assisting users in locating and checking out library materials, organizing library shelves, preparing 
materials for checkout, and generally providing outstanding service.


